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Alerts

1 event
38 results matching for 'Assignments before Grant' during August 2005.

Number Title Date
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2001237875 New self emulsifying drug delivery system 10 Aug 2005

2001240834 Mass labels 10 Aug 2005

2001253245 Method and apparatus for monitoring the effective velocity of items through a store or
warehouse

10 Aug 2005

2001282570 Plant having improved tolerance to various environmental stresses, method of
constructing the same and polyamine metabolism-relating enzyme gene

10 Aug 2005

2001296783 Stapling and cutting in resectioning for full thickness resection devices 10 Aug 2005

2002211986 Seal cavity throat protectors 10 Aug 2005

2002214111 Anti-adiposis composition based on garlic bulb extracts 10 Aug 2005

2002251533 Protein involved in restoration of cytoplasmic male sterility to fertility and gene encoding
the protein and gene

10 Aug 2005

2002252345 Replaceable prism for applanation tonometer 10 Aug 2005

2002252729 HIGH MOLECULAR WEIGHT PRIMARY ALIPHATIC ALCOHOLS OBTAINED
FROM NATURAL PRODUCTS AND USES THEREOF

10 Aug 2005

2002301183 Gaming machine having bonus game 10 Aug 2005

2002301197 Video gaming machine with pop-up windows 10 Aug 2005

2002301512 Knife and blade sharpener 10 Aug 2005

2002325785 PVB film containing a plastifying agent 10 Aug 2005

2002331952 Mass labels 10 Aug 2005

2002340224 Oligoamine compounds and derivatives thereof for cancer therapy 10 Aug 2005

2002351245 Disposable aerosol generator system and methods for administering the aerosol 10 Aug 2005

2002357978 Film for composite security disks with self-adhesiveness 10 Aug 2005

2002358849 Allium sativum bulb absolutes and therapeutic or cosmetic uses 10 Aug 2005

2002362051 Aerosol generator with a heater for vaporization 10 Aug 2005

2002364539 CYCLOALKYL SUBSTITUTED POLYAMINES FOR CANCER THERAPY AND
METHODS OF SYNTHESIS THEREFOR

10 Aug 2005

2002365843 Method of making a finished product 10 Aug 2005

2002367002 System and method for controlling a filter to enhance speakerphone performance 10 Aug 2005

2003207547 Aerosol generator for drug formulation 10 Aug 2005

2003221058 Plant with improved organogenesis and method of constructing the same 10 Aug 2005

2003227399 Variable beam antenna device, transmitter-receiver and network notebook 10 Aug 2005

2003246298 Retractable blinds 10 Aug 2005

2003263818 System and method for multiple-input multiple-output (MIMO) radio communication 10 Aug 2005

2003295933 Methods and apparatus for remodeling an extravascular tissue structure 10 Aug 2005

2003296971 ALCOHOL ENHANCED ALTERNATIVE FUELS 10 Aug 2005

2004200907 Reconfigurable Scaffolding Frame Assembly 10 Aug 2005

2004201605 Automatic tracking method for golf swing 10 Aug 2005

2004203260 A kitchen utensil and method of manufacture 10 Aug 2005

2004203262 A blade sharpening system and an edge restoring unit capable of use therewith 10 Aug 2005

2004204412 Methods for monitoring resin-loading of wood materials and engineered wood products 10 Aug 2005

2004269786 Leaf snatcher 10 Aug 2005
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2005201115 Quinones for treatment of diseases 10 Aug 2005

2005201724 Novel polyamine analog conjugates and quinone conjugates as therapies for cancers and
prostate diseases

10 Aug 2005

http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2005201115
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Terms and Conditions
General

The information provided in this report is not in the nature of legal or other professional advice.

The information provided in this report is derived from third parties and may contain errors. You must
make your own enquiries and seek independent advice from the relevant industry professionals
regarding any information in this report.

Patents, patent applications, trademarks and trademark applications shown as lapsed or ceased may be
restored at a later date.

Disclaimer of warranty and limitation of liability

Neither IPMonitor, its affiliates nor any of their respective employees, agents, third party content
providers or licensors warrant that the information contained in this report is error free; nor do they
make any warranty as to the accuracy, reliability or content of any information in this report.

This report is provided on an "as is" basis; to the maximum extent permitted by law, IPMonitor
disclaims all representations and warranties, express or implied, with respect to any information
conatined in this report. In addition, IPMonitor does not represent or warrant that the information
contained in this report is accurate, complete or current.

This disclaimer of liability applies to any damages or injury caused by any failure of performance,
error, omission, interruption, deletion, defect, delay in operation or transmission, computer virus,
communication line failure, theft or destruction or unauthorized access to, alteration of, or use of
record, whether for breach of contract, tortious behavior, negligence, or under any other cause of
action.

Copyright

The content of this report may be protected by copyright laws and treaties around the world and all
rights relating to the same are reserved. Any paper or digital copies of this report are not to be
modified or any illustrations or any graphics used separately from any accompanying text.

Arbitration

Any dispute or difference whatsoever arising out of or in connection with this report shall be
submitted to arbitration in accordance with, and subject to, The Institute of Arbitrators & Mediators
Australia Rules for the Conduct of Commercial Arbitrations.

IPMonitor reserves the right to update the Terms and Conditions at any time without notice. Please
see the full Terms and Conditions at www.IPMonitor.com.au/trademarks/info/terms
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